
Legal Supplement Part A to the “Trinidad and Tobago Gazette’’, Vol. 42,
No. 107, 24th July, 2003

First Session Eighth Parliament Republic of Trinidad
and Tobago

REPUBLIC  OF  TRINIDAD  AND  TOBAGO

Act No. 20 of 2003

[L.S.]

AN ACT to amend the Income Tax Act, Chap. 75:01

[Assented to 21st July, 2003]

ENACTED by the Parliament of Trinidad and Tobago as
follows:—

l. This Act may be cited as the Income Tax
(Amendment) (No. 2) Act, 2003.

Short title

Enactment



2. In this Act, “the Act” means the Income Tax Act.

3. Section 5 of the Act is amended—
(a) in subsection (6)(a) by deleting the words

“one hundred thousand dollars” and
substituting the words “three hundred
thousand dollars”; and

(b) in subsection (10) by deleting the words
“one hundred thousand dollars” and
substituting the words “three hundred
thousand dollars”,

with effect from the year of income commencing
1st January, 2003.

4. The Ninth Schedule to the Act is amended in rule 1,
by deleting the words “National Training Board” and
substituting the words “Ministry responsible for the
National Training Agency”.

Passed in the House of Representatives this 6th day
of June, 2003.

J.  SAMPSON-JACENT
Clerk of the House

Passed in the Senate this 15th day of July, 2003.

D. DOLLY
Clerk of the Senate

Interpretation
Chap. 75:01

Ninth Schedule
amended

Section 5 amended

66 No. 20 Income Tax (Amendment) (No. 2) 2003

PRINTED BY THE GOVERNMENT PRINTER,  PORT-OF-SPAIN

REPUBLIC OF TRINIDAD AND TOBAGO—2003


