
 

 

HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
FIFTH SESSION NO. 8 

TENTH PARLIAMENT 2014/2015 

 

ORDER PAPER 
THURSDAY SEPTEMBER 18, 2014: 1:30 P.M. 

 

 
PRAYERS  
   
OATH OR AFFIRMATION  
  
ANNOUNCEMENTS BY THE SPEAKER 
 
BILLS BROUGHT FROM THE SENATE 
 
PETITIONS  
 
PAPERS 
 
REPORTS FROM COMMITTEES 
 
PRIME MINISTER’S QUESTIONS 
 
URGENT QUESTIONS 
 
QUESTIONS ON NOTICE 
 
REQUESTS FOR LEAVE TO MOVE THE ADJOURNMENT OF THE HOUSE ON 
DEFINITE MATTERS OF URGENT PUBLIC IMPORTANCE 
 
STATEMENTS BY MINISTERS 
 
PERSONAL EXPLANATIONS 
 
INTRODUCTION OF BILLS 
 
MOTIONS RELATING TO THE BUSINESS OR SITTINGS OF THE HOUSE AND 
MOVED BY A MINISTER 
 
PUBLIC BUSINESS  
 

GOVERNMENT BUSINESS 
Motions: 
 

1. BE IT RESOLVED that the Senate amendments to the Constitution (Amendment) Bill, 
2014 listed in the Appendix be now considered.  

(By the Prime Minister) 



 

 2 

 
Bills Second Reading: 
 

1. The debate on the Second Reading of the following Bill which was in progress when 
the House adjourned on Wednesday September 17, 2014 will be resumed: 

A Bill entitled, “An Act to provide for the service of Trinidad and Tobago for the financial 
year ending on the 30th day of September, 2015”. 

(By the Minister of Finance and the Economy) 
 

2. A Bill entitled, “An Act to amend the Proceeds of Crime Act, Chap. 11:27, the Anti-
Terrorism Act, Chap. 12:07 and the Financial Intelligence Unit of Trinidad and Tobago Act, 
Chap. 72:01”. 

(By the Minister of Finance and the Economy) 
 

3. A Bill entitled, “An Act to provide for public procurement, and for the retention and disposal 
of public property, in accordance with the principles of good governance, namely 
accountability, transparency, integrity and value for money, the establishment of the Office 
of Procurement Regulation, the repeal of the Central Tenders Board Act, Chap. 71:91 and 
related matters”. 

(By the Minister of Planning and Sustainable Development) 
  

4. A Bill entitled, “An Act to amend the Registration of Deeds Act, Chap. 19:06 and the Real 
Property Act, Chap. 56:02”. 

(By the Minister of Legal Affairs) 
 
 

 
 

 
    Jacqui Sampson-Meiguel 

               Clerk of the House 
 
 
 
House of Representatives’ Secretariat 
The Port of Spain International Waterfront Centre 
Level 3, Tower D 
1 A Wrightson Road 
PORT OF SPAIN 
 
September 18, 2014 
 



 

 
 

APPENDIX 
 

 
The Constitution (Amendment) Bill, 2014 

 
 List of Amendments made in the Senate at the Committee Stage of the  

Constitution (Amendment) Bill, 2014 
 
 
 

First Column 

Clause 

 

Second Column 

Extent of Amendment 

6 A. In the proposed section 49B- 
 

(a) In subsection (2)(a), delete the words “three years” 
and substitute the words “two years and six months”; 

 
(b) Insert after subsection (2), the following subsections: 
 
        “(3)    The Elections and Boundaries Commission 

shall, within two weeks from the date that an application 
is received under subsection (1), cause notice of the 
application to be- 

 
(a) published in the Gazette, at least two 

newspapers in daily circulation in 
Trinidad and Tobago and on its website; 
and 

(b) made available for inspection and 
signature at the place or places 
designated in the notice and during the 
times specified in the notice. 
 

        (4)      A notice published under subsection (3) shall- 
 

(a) designate the place or places at which 
the application is available for 
signature; and 

(b) state that the application shall be made 
available for inspection and signature 
between the hours of 8.00 a.m. and 4.00 
p.m. for a period of twenty-one days 
from the date of its first publication in 
a newspaper, including Saturdays and 
Sundays, but not on public holidays.”; 

  

 

 



 

 2 

 
First Column 

Clause 

 

Second Column 

Extent of Amendment 

6 (c)   Delete subsections (5) and (6) and renumber 
subsections (3) and (4) as (5) and (6), 
respectively; 

 
(d)      In the renumbered subsection (5), in paragraph 

(a), delete the words “ten per cent” and 
substitute the words “twenty per cent”;  

 
(e)     In the renumbered subsection (6) – 
 

(i) delete the words “three years” and 
substitute the words “two years and six 
months”; and 

 
          (ii)  delete the words “signatures in”; 
 
(f)   In subsection (7) – 
 

(i) delete from the word “-” to the words 
“(b)”; and 

 
(ii) delete the words “ten per cent” and 

substitute the words “twenty per cent”;  
 
(g)  In subsection (8)(b), delete the words “Form No. 

3” and  substitute the words “Form No. 2”; and 
 
(h)  In subsection (11), delete the words “Form No. 4”  
      and  substitute the words “Form No. 3”. 

 
B. In section 49C(7), delete the words “Form No. 4” and 
substitute the words “Form No. 3”. 
 

8 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

A. Insert after the words “is amended”, the following: 
 
“ – 

(a) in subsection (1), by deleting the words “The election” 
and substituting the words “Subject to subsections (3), 
(4), (5), (6) and (7), the election”; and 

(b) ”. 
 

 
 
 
 

 



 

 3 

First Column 

Clause 
 
 

8 

Second Column 

                                    Extent of Amendment 
 
 
B.  In the proposed subsection (4) – 
 

(a)        delete the word “Where” and substitute the words 
“Subject to subsections (5), (6) and (7), where”; 
and 

 
(b)        delete the words “those candidates who earned the 

highest and” and substitute the words “the 
candidate who earned the highest and the 
candidate who earned the”. 

 
                             C.  Insert after the proposed subsection (4), the following subsection: 
 

“ (5) A candidate, other than a candidate referred to in 
           subsection (4) -  
 

(a) who earns at least twenty-five per cent of the 
votes cast in a first poll; and 

 
(b) whose votes fall within a margin of five per cent 

of the votes earned by- 
 

(i) the candidate obtaining the second 
highest number of votes; or 

 
(ii) the two candidates who earned the highest 

number of votes, in the event of an 
equality of votes between those two 
candidates, 

 
         may contest the supplementary poll. 
 

(6)  Notwithstanding subsection (3), where a supplementary poll 
is held among three or more candidates, the candidate who obtains the 
highest number of votes shall be declared the candidate having the 
highest number of votes to be elected under subsection (1). 

 
(7) For the avoidance of doubt, where there is an equality of votes 

between two candidates obtaining the highest number of votes and no 
other candidate earns twenty-five per cent or more of the votes, the 
supplementary poll shall be held between those candidates.”. 

 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 4 

 

First Column 

Clause 
 

     

   
                                     Second Column 

                                    Extent of Amendment 
 

           10 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 
 
 

 

In the proposed Fourth Schedule: 
 

(a) Delete the words “[Sections 49B(1), (6), (8)(b) and 
(11) and 49C(7)]” and substitute the words 
“[Sections 49B(1), (8)(b) and (11) and 49C(7)]”;  

 
(b) In the proposed Form No. 1, delete the words “ten 

per cent” and substitute the words “twenty per 
cent”; and  

 
(c) Delete the proposed Form No. 2 and renumber 

Form No. 3 and Form No. 4 as Form No. 2 and 
Form No. 3, respectively.                

11 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

A. In the Schedule, in paragraph (b)(ii), in the proposed 
section 33(3)(b)(i)(B), delete the words “of the first poll” 
and substitute the words “on which the results of the first 
poll are declared in writing by the Returning Officer”. 

B. In the proposed amendment to rule 101 of the Election Rules-  

(a) Delete subrule (1)(b)(ii) and substitute the following: 
 
           “ (ii) that a supplementary poll shall be held within fifteen 

days- 
 (A)  between  those candidates who earned the 

highest and  second highest number of votes;                                            
 

(B)  where there is an equality of votes between 
two candidates obtaining the highest number 
of  votes, between those two candidates; or 

    
 (C)  among the candidates referred to in sub-

subparagraphs (A) or  (B) and any  other 
candidate-who earned  at least twenty-five 
per cent  of the votes and whose votes fall 
within a margin of five per cent of the votes 
earned by the candidate obtaining the second 
highest number of votes or the candidates 
referred to in sub-subparagraph (B),”; 

 
 
 
 



 

 5 

First Column 

Clause 
 

11 

 

             

Second Column 

                                    Extent of Amendment 
 

     
(b) in subrule (17), delete the words “or (c)”; and 

  
(c) delete subrule (18) and insert the following rule: 

 
“(18) Where a recount- 
 

(a) under subrule (16)(b) results in an 
equality of votes among three or more 
candidates; or 
 

(b) under subrule (16)(c) does not result in- 
                                   

(i)  one candidate obtaining the 
most votes and one other 
candidate obtaining the second 
most votes; and 

 
(ii)  one candidate obtaining more 

than fifty percent of the votes, 
 

the Chief Election Officer shall so certify to the 
Returning Officer who shall declare the poll void and a 
new poll shall, as soon as possible, be held in 
accordance with these Rules.”. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 
 

C.  In the proposed amendments to the Election Rules, 
renumber paragraphs (r) to (t) as paragraphs (s) to (u) and insert 
after paragraph (q), the following paragraph: 
 

“(r)       renumber rule 105 as rule 105(1) and insert 
thereafter the following subrule: 

 
“ (2) Notwithstanding subrule (1), where a 

supplementary poll is to take place following 
the first poll of a general election, the 
Returning Officer (shall maintain custody of 
the unit registers of electors together with the 
keys of the binders, the register of special 
electors and the relevant files of answers to 
questions after the first poll and shall, within 
seven days after the supplementary poll, return 
them to the Registration Officers from whom 
he received the same; and the Registration 
Officers shall give to the Returning Officer a 
receipt for the same.”. 

 
Senate Secretariat 

August 29, 2014 
 


